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Anﬂel

From: Teresa Chen <cxy0908@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 5:31 PM
To: enquiry_reply@unitedchannel.net
Subject: Re: Termination of SAN IANG ZING

[ WHEIRER] 11-28 13:45 HE LA T1 %-11-28 15:15 MG EFrHL7 T1 P40 E bR 2 8M232,
T B 2380782422515 (i 45 A AT BA-5 . 5662a45f-2ca9-41al-h351-066ae8ccalch) C I,
SAN/IANGZING 25 599-5083070235. fith th.cn/wfdOssw BFTREVELGE B LIPEIR M. 1HHEHT
Z/b 3N BENUIS A FRE L. EEREE . EHIVEIRIBIE, WEIENEMRIEE . MRS RS B
B, R EF . LHMRS G, 0755-82865688,  KHEARSLiE: 9510208 , HESHHIE
PRFT 86-0571-56888688.

Get Outlook for 108

From: Teresa Chen <cxy0908 @hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2019 5:27:45 PM

To: enquiry_reply@unitedchannel.net <enquiry_reply@unitedchannel.net>
Subject: Fwd: Termination of SAN IANG ZING

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Teresa Chen <cxy0908@hotmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, November 23, 2019 8:03 PM
To: unitedes@singnet.com

Subject: Termination of SAN IANG ZING

Hi Angel,

As talked a few days ago, Zing requested to terminate her contract last Sunday because
her father was hospitalised.

[ have bought her the ticket (p86= YANGON, .28 Nov ETD 13:45 8M232).
Pls proceed necessary doc for her and let me what else [ need to do.
Regards

CHEN XINGYAN



